BID DOCUMENT

| <u>ITEM</u> | QUANTITY | PRICE | Packed |
|--|---------------------------|---|---|
| 1. Cleaner/Deodorizer Wefak "Neutral Cleaner" | 100 Gal. | <u>5,26 /</u> Gal. | 25gallpail |
| 2. Brooms Greenword 561 | 36 Each | <u>4.52</u> /Each | 12/05 |
| 3. Mop compound Wepak "Nerwyal Cleaner" | 100 Gal. | <u>5,26</u> /Gal. | 5gal/pail |
| 4. Tile Floor Wax | 300 Gal. Minimum order | <u>9.83</u> /Gal. 150 gallons | 5 gal/pail |
| 5. Garden Sprayer RL FloyMaster 1973 | 12 Each | 21,7%/Each | 12/05 |
| 6. Glass Cleaner Wepak "Glass Cleaner" | 100 Gal. | <u>8.33</u> /Gal. | 5 gal/pail |
| 7. Liquid Hand Cleaner Inopak 5011-420-02 | 150 Gal. Minimum order | <u>4.79</u> /Gal. 84 gall <i>on</i> | Egal/cs |
| 8. Cleaner Disinfectant Wepak "Lennon Disinfectal | 100 Gal. | 6.08/Gal. | 3 gal/part |
| 9. Bathroom Cleaner Wepak "NH Bath Disinfectal | 420 cases | 15.29 /case | 12 97/05 |
| Wepak "Emulsified Stripper | 60 Gal. | <u>8,95</u> /Gal. | 5 gal/part |
| 11. Rubber Gloves (Medium) <i>Cremesis HL-100</i> | 100 Pair | <u>.47</u> /Pair | 124 projet |
| (Large) | 200 Pair | <u>. 47</u> /Pair | 1480100 |
| 12. Spray Heads Grenesi 5 BB 550610 | 150 Each | 136 /Each | 200/05 |
| 13. Urinal Screens Tolco 221149 | 200 each | <u>. %</u> /Each | 12/05 |
| 14. Scrub Pads | 100 Each | No Bid /Each | |
| 15. Screen Disc 20" | 20 each | No lid /Each | |
| 16. Shop Towels have a blood at | 20 Cases | No Bill /Case | |
| 17. Disposable Gloves Genesis LA-PF | 40 cases | 42,16/Case | 180/6× 186465 12/CS 12/CS 24/CS 12/CS |
| 18. Feather Dusters Land Land Allow | 48 Each | 5.96 /Each | 12/05 |
| 19. Wet Mop Frame w/Handle Genresis BB150160 | 48 Each | <u>5.18</u> /Each | 12/03 |
| 20. Lamb's Wool Pads Genesis BB450212 | 24 Each | <u>2,49</u> /Each | 24/05 |
| 21. Dust Mop Handles | 24 Each | 5.38 /Each | 12/05 |
| Grenesis BBI70560 | | GENESIS J P.O. Box Rock Hill, SC 2 Phone 803-3 Fax 803-32 | 11226 11226 19731-1226 198-6633 |

15

a 1, 1

| 22. Gym Floor Finish 75 Gal. M_{effed} Gal. 23. Cleaner/Degreaser 50 Gal. M_{effed} Gal. 24. Mop Buckets w/Wringer 6 Each M_{effed} Gal. 25. Floor Polish 40 Gal. M_{effed} Gal. 26. Dust Mop Heads (18") 24 each M_{effed} Each M_{effed} Gal. 26. Dust Mop Heads (18") 24 each M_{effed} Each M_{effed} Gal. 26. Dust Mop Heads (18") 24 each M_{effed} Each M_{effed} Gal. 26. Dust Mop Heads (18") 24 each M_{effed} Each M_{effed} Gal. 27. Trash can liners (16x14x36) 300 cases M_{effed} Case (22x14x58) 250 cases M_{effed} Case 28. Toilet tissue (22x14x58) 250 cases M_{effed} Case 29. Floor pads 150 cases M_{effed} Case 20 inch natural hair 10 cases M_{effed} Case 20 inch white 50 cases M_{effed} Case 20 inch white 50 cases M_{effed} Case 20 inch duck 10 cases M_{effed} Case 20 inch green 10 cases M_{effed} Case M_{effed} Case M_{effed} Case 20 inch white 50 cases M_{effed} Case M_{effed} Case M_{effed} Case | | | | 7 | acheq |
|---|--|--|-----------------------------------|---|--|
| 24. Mop Buckets w/Wringer Green Wurd 274 25. Floor Polish6 Each $\frac{1977}{16}$ EachEach25. Floor Polish40 Gal. $\frac{1977}{16}$ Each $\frac{12}{16}$ Cs.26. Dust Mop Heads Genesid BUT70218 (36") 24 Each $\frac{3}{14}$ /Each $\frac{12}{12}$ Cs.26. Dust Mop Heads Genesid BUT70218 (36") 24 Each $\frac{3}{14}$ /Each $\frac{12}{12}$ Cs.26. Dust Mop Heads Genesid BUT70218 (36") 24 Each $\frac{3}{14}$ /Each $\frac{12}{12}$ Cs.26. Dust Mop Heads (48") 24 Each $\frac{13}{12}$ /Cs. $\frac{12}{165}$ 27. Trash can liners (16x14x36)300 cases $\frac{16}{12}$ /Case27. Trash can liners (16x14x36)300 cases $\frac{16}{12}$ /Case28. Toilet tissue (22x14x58)250 cases $\frac{16}{12}$ /Case28. Toilet tissue (20 inch natural hair10 cases $\frac{11}{38}$ /Case20 inch natural hair10 cases $\frac{11}{38}$ /Case20 inch white 20 inch black10 cases $\frac{11}{32}$ /Case20 inch black10 cases $\frac{11}{32}$ /Case20 inch green10 cases $\frac{11}{32}$ /Case20 inch black10 cases $\frac{11}{32}$ /Case20 inch black10 cases $\frac{11}{32}$ /Case20 inch green10 cases $\frac{11}{32}$ /Case30. Dust Mop Frames (18") Genesis BU 1704366 each $\frac{1}{3}$ /2/Each31. Jamitor's cart Genesis BU 1704466 each $\frac{1}{3}$ /2/Each32. Terrazzo Floor Finish30 gal. $\frac{10}{4}$ /Bid/dal. | 22. Gym Floor | r Finish | 75 Gal. | No Bid/Gal. | |
| PrimePrimePrimePrimeGreen Word27440 Gal. M_{2} Bid/Gal.25. Floor Polish40 Gal. M_{2} Bid/Gal.26. Dust Mop Heads(18") 24 each 3_{1} H/2 Each $12/c5$ Gettesh Bill 70218(36") 24 Each 4_{1} H/2 Each $12/c5$ $fettesh Bill 70218(36") 24 Each4_{1} H/2 Each12/c5fettesh Bill 70218(36") 24 Each4_{1} H/2 Each12/c5fettesh Bill 70218(48") 24 Each5_{1} H/2 Each12/c5fettesh Bill 70248(48") 24 Each5_{1} H/2 Each12/c527. Trash can liners (16x14x36)300 casesM_{2} Bid/Case(22x14x58)250 casesM_{2} Bid/Case(22x14x58)250 casesM_{2} Bid/Case(22x14x58)250 casesM_{2} Bid/Case28. Toilet tissue150 casesM_{2} Bid/Case(20 inch natural hair10 casesM_{1} Bid/Case20 inch black10 casesM_{1} Case20 inch green10 casesM_{1} Case20 inch green10 casesM_{1} CaseM_{1} Bid GasM_{1} CaseM_{1} CaseM_{1} Bid GasM_{1} CaseM_{1} CaseM_{1} Bid GasM_{1} CaseM_{1} CaseM_{2} Bid Abve paddsm_{2} CaseM_{1} Case20 inch redpaddsm_{2} CaseM_{1} CaseM_{2} Bid Abve paddsm_{2} CaseM_{1} CaseM_{2} Bid M_{2} Bid M_{2} Bid M_{2} Bid$ | 23. Cleaner/D | egreaser | 50 Gal. | VI | |
| 25. Floor Polish 40 Gal. Me $IM/Gal.$ 26. Dust Mop Heads (18") 24 each $3.14/1$ Each $12/05$ Genesis $BB1702.18$ (36") 24 Each $4.324/1$ Each $12/05$ VB1702.36 (48") 24 Each $4.324/1$ Each $12/05VB1702.36$ (48") 24 Each $4.324/1$ Each $12/05BB1702.443$ (48") 24 Each $5.64/1$ Each $12/05BB1702.443$ (48") 24 Each $5.64/1$ Each $12/0527. Trash can liners (16x14x36) 300 cases 16164/1Case(22x14x58) 250 cases 16178/1Case(22x14x58) 250 cases 16178/1Case(20 inch natural hair 10 cases 11/32/1Case20 inch white 50 cases 1678/1Case20 inch white 50 cases 1678/1Case20 inch black 10 cases 1672/1Case20 inch green 10 cases 1672/1Case10/23/1$ Case $1672/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $167/1$ Case $167/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $167/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $167/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $167/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $167/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $167/1$ Case 10/23/1Case $16/24/1$ Case 10/23/1Case 10/23/1Case $16/24/1$ Case 10/23/1Case 10/ | | | 6 Each | 49.93/Each | Each |
| $\begin{cases} UV170236 \\ BB170244 \\ (48") 24 Each \\ 564_1Each \\ 12/65 \\ \hline BB170244 \\ \hline Case \\ (22x14x58) \\ 250 cases \\ (22x14x58) \\ 250 case \\ 20 inch natural hair \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch white \\ 50 case \\ 20 inch white \\ 50 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 case \\ 10 c$ | 25. Floor Polis | 600 276 sh | 40 Gal. | No Bid/Gal. | |
| $\begin{cases} UV170236 \\ BB170244 \\ (48") 24 Each \\ 564_1Each \\ 12/65 \\ \hline BB170244 \\ \hline Case \\ (22x14x58) \\ 250 cases \\ (22x14x58) \\ 250 case \\ 20 inch natural hair \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch white \\ 50 case \\ 20 inch white \\ 50 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 cases \\ (1238/Case \\ 20 inch green \\ 10 case \\ 10 c$ | 26. Dust Mop | Heads | (18") 24 each | 3.14/Each | 12/05 |
| $BBITD 2443$ 27. Trash can liners (16x14x36)300 cases $M_2 I_{ab} Case$ (22x14x58)250 cases $M_2 I_{ab} Case$ (22x14x58)250 cases $M_2 I_{ab} Case$ 28. Toilet tissue150 cases $D_3 24_2 23 Case$ $M_2 I_{ab} er (IEN 215)$ $M_{ab} initial with arder 40 cases$ 29. Floor pads20 inch natural hair10 cases20 inch white50 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch white50 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch black10 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch green10 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch red10 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch green10 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch red10 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 20 inch red10 cases $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each $M_2 I_2 I_2 Case$ 30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each 3.92_2 /Each $M_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_3 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2 I_2$ | Genesis | BB170218 | (36") 24 Each | 4.84/Each | |
| $\begin{array}{cccccccccccccccccccccccccccccccccccc$ | an Constant | BB170236 BB170249 | (48") 24 Each | 5.6/ /Each | 12/05 |
| 28. Toilet tissue Centeral Paper GEN 215 29. Floor pads 20 inch natural hair 10 cases 20 inch white 20 inch white 20 inch black 20 inch black 20 inch black 20 inch black 10 cases 20 inch black 10 cases 20 inch green 10 cases 20 inch red 20 inch red 20 inch red 10 cases 20 inch red 20 inch red 10 cases 20 inch red 20 inch red 2 | 27. Trash can | liners (16x14x36) | 300 cases | | |
| Cettestal Paper GEN 215Minimum under Holer Holdstage29. Floor pads20 inch natural hair10 cases 11.38 /Case20 inch white50 cases 11.78 /Case20 inch white50 cases 11.78 /Case20 inch black10 cases 11.78 /Case20 inch green10 cases 11.78 /Case20 inch red10 cases 11.78 /Case30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each 21.68 /Fach30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each 21.68 /Fach31. Janutor's cart6 each 31.92 /Fach31. Janutor's cart4 each 24.82 /Fach32. Terrazzo Floor Finish30 gal. $N0$ Bid/Gal. | | (22x14x58) | 250 cases | No Bid /Case | |
| 20 inch white 50 cases <u>IATK</u> /Case 20 inch black 10 cases <u>IATK</u> /Case 20 inch black 10 cases <u>IATK</u> /Case 20 inch green 10 cases <u>IATK</u> /Case 20 inch red 10 cases <u>IATK</u> /Case 30 Dust Mop Frames (18") 6 each <u>2.68</u> /Each 30 Dust Mop Frames (36") 6 each <u>3.922</u> /Each <u>IA/C5</u> Genesis BB /70446 6 each <u>3.922</u> /Each <u>IA/C5</u> Just Mop Frames (48") 6 each <u>5.1/4</u> /Fach <u>IA/C5</u> Genesis BB /70446 4 each <u>94.82</u> /Each <u>Each</u> 3 | 28. Toilet tiss <i>Genera</i> 29. Floor pade | ue 1 Paper GEN 21 | 150 cases Minimum ender | 10 34 28 Case 40 Casco | |
| 20 inch black10 cases $\underline{M.78}/Case$ 20 inch green10 cases $\underline{M.78}/Case$ 20 inch red10 cases $\underline{M.78}/Case$ 20 inch red0 cases $\underline{M.78}/Case$ 20 inch red10 cases $\underline{M.78}/Case$ 20 inch red0 cases $\underline{M.78}/Case$ 0 y de y 05 350 cases0 y de y of de y of de y of de y30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each $\underline{L.68}/Each$ $Mpt'5$ $\underline{M}/5$ $\underline{M}/5$ Dust Mop Frames (36")6 each $\underline{3.92}/Each$ $Mpt'5$ $\underline{M}/65$ $\underline{M}/65$ $Mpt Frames (48")$ 6 each $\underline{3.92}/Each$ $Mpt'5$ $\underline{M}/65$ $\underline{M}/65$ 31. Janitor's cart4 each $\underline{74.82}/Each$ $Mpt'6$ 30 gal. $\underline{Mpt'6}/Gal.$ | | 20 inch natural hair | 10 cases | 11.38/Case | 5/08 |
| 20 inch green10 cases10.78 /Case20 inch red10 cases10.78 /Case11 of the above pads muss be order at the same time, a minimu order of 35 cases of mixed pads muss be ordered.30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each11 denesis BB / 1044512 denesis BB / 1044513 denesis BB / 1044514 denesis BB / 1044615 denesis BB / 1044616 denesis BB / 1044617 denesis BB / 1044617 denesis BB / 1044618 denesis BB / 1044619 denesis BB / 1044619 denesis BB / 1044610 cases10 cases11 danior's cart12 denesis BB / 1044613 danior's cart14 each15 denesis BB / 16464816 denesis BB / 16464817 denesis BB / 16464818 denesis BB / 16464819 denesis BB / 16464810 denesis BB / 16464811 denior's cart12 denesis BB / 16464813 denior's cart14 each15 denesis BB / 16464816 denesis BB / 16464817 denesis BB / 16464818 denesis BB / 16464819 denesis BB / 16464810 denesis BB / 16464810 denesis BB / 16464811 denior's cart12 denesis BB / 16464813 denior's cart14 each16 denesis BB / 16464817 denesis BB / 16464818 denesis BB / 16464819 denesis BB / 16464819 denesis BB / 16464810 denesis BB / 16464810 denesi | | 20 inch white | 50 cases | 10.78 /Case | (|
| 20 inch red 10 cases $10.78/1$ Case HII of the above paids multiple be order at the same time, a minimula order 05 35 catters of mixed paids must be ordered. 30. Dust Mop Frames (18") 6 each $2.68/1$ Each $12/15$ Genesis BB 170445 Dust Mop Frames (36") 6 each $3.92/1$ Each $12/15$ Genesis BB 170446 Dust Mop Frames (48") 6 each $5.1/4/1$ Each $12/15$ Genesis BB 170446 31. Janitor's cart 4 each $94.82/1$ Each Each Gremesis BB/154048 32. Terrazzo Floor Finish 30 gal. No Bid/Gal. | | 20 inch black | 10 cases | 10.78 /Case | |
| 30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each 2.68 /Each $12/03$ Genesis BB / 704/186 each 3.92 /Each $12/05$ Dust Mop Frames (36")6 each 3.92 /Each $12/05$ Dust Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Dust Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Just Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Just Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Genesis BB / 704404 each 94.82 /Each $Each$ 31. Janitor's cart4 each 94.82 /Each $Each$ Genesis BB / 5404830 gal. $No Bid$ /Gal. | | 20 inch green | 10 cases | 10,78 /Case |) |
| 30. Dust Mop Frames (18")6 each 2.68 /Each $12/03$ Genesis BB / 704/186 each 3.92 /Each $12/05$ Dust Mop Frames (36")6 each 3.92 /Each $12/05$ Dust Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Dust Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Just Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Just Mop Frames (48")6 each $5.1/4$ /Each $12/05$ Genesis BB / 704404 each 94.82 /Each $Each$ 31. Janitor's cart4 each 94.82 /Each $Each$ Genesis BB / 5404830 gal. $No Bid$ /Gal. | All of | 20 inch red The above part OF 35 cases | ds muse be order of mixed pads | 10,78 /Case at the same the must be orde | me, a minimum |
| Greenesis \mathcal{B} \mathcal{I} | 30. Dust Mop | Frames (18") | | | 12/05 |
| Dust Mop Frames (48") 6 each 5.14/2 Genesis BB/10448 31. Janitor's cart 4 each 94.82/Each Each Genesis BB/154048 30 gal. No Bid/Gal. | Dust Mop | Frames (36") | 6 each | 3,92 /Each | 12/05 |
| 31. Janitor's cart4 each <u>44.82</u> /EachEachGewebib BB/5404830 gal.No Bid /Gal. | Dust Mop | Frames (48") | 6 each | 5./4/Each | 12/05 |
| 32. Terrazzo Floor Finish 30 gal. <i>No Bid</i> /Gal. | 31. Janitor's | cart | 4 each | 94.82/Each | Each |
| | Gremesis 32. Terrazzo | Floor Finish | 30 gal. | No Bid /Gal. | |
| 33. Dustpans 20 each 2.54 /Each $12/C5$ | | RB HILLIS | 20 each | 2.54 /Each | 12/05 |
| Greenesis BB 410412 34. Disinfectant Wipes 250 cases <u>39,85</u> /Case 6 Tubb/C5 | 34. Disinfect | tant Wipes | 250 cases | <u> 39,85</u> /Case | 6 Tubs/05 |
| 33. Dustpans 20 each 2.54/Each 12/C5 Grennesis BB 4/10412 250 cases 39.85/Case 12/C5 34. Disinfectant Wipes 250 cases 39.85/Case 6 Tub5/C5 Clainee C 915 Minimum or der 40 cases GENESIS II, INC. PO. Box 11226 Pone 803-328-6633 Phone 803-328-3933 | Claime C 915 | | Minimzun order | W Calses GENESIS P.O. Box Rock Hill, SC Phone 803- Eax 803-3 | II, INC. 11226 29731-1226 328-6633 28-3933 |

| 35. Facial Tissue | AFAI EMATMI - 20/10A | 100 cases | 16.80 /case | Jojour |
|---|----------------------|-----------|--------------|--------|
| Gremeral Paper 36. Absorbent | GEN FACIAL-39/00 | 20 cases | No Bid Icase | |
| 37. Bleach | | 10 cases | No Bid Icase | |
| 38. Laundry Detergent | | 10 each | No Bid /Each | |
| | | 15 cases | 39.68 /case | 12/05 |
| 39. Wet Mop Heads Greenwood | 332 | | | |

NOTE: All amounts are approximate. More or less of any item may be purchased.

GENESIS II, INC. P.O. Box 11226 Rock Hill, SC 29731-1226 Phone 803-328-6633 Fax 803-328-3933

Email: genesisinc@comportum.net William Cox 6-Vice President

6-18-13